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Abstract	
Financial	revenue	is	an	important	economic	indicator	reflecting	the	level	of	a	country's	
economic	development,	and	is	the	financial	guarantee	and	prerequisite	for	realizing	the	
salary	payment	and	normal	operation	of	the	staff	of	state	organs	and	institutions	and	the	
development	 of	 various	 economic	 and	 social	 undertakings.	 This	 paper	 empirically	
analyzes	 the	 influencing	 factors	 of	 fiscal	 revenue	 by	 reviewing	 the	 relevant	 data	 of	
China's	fiscal	revenue	from	2012	to	2021.	The	relevant	model	is	established	by	eViews	
software,	 and	 then	 the	model	 is	 tested	 and	modified	 through	 statistical	 test,	 partial	
correlation	coefficient	test,	BG	test,	generalized	difference	method,	GQ	test,	and	finally	
the	optimal	model	is	obtained	to	analyze	the	correlation	of	influencing	factors	on	China's	
fiscal	 revenue,	 so	 as	 to	 draw	 corresponding	 conclusions	 and	 make	 suggestions	 to	
improve	China's	fiscal	revenue	and	economic	growth.	The	study	shows	that	industrial	
GDP	has	a	significant	 impact	on	 fiscal	revenue,	and	puts	 forward	suggestions	such	as	
increasing	 GDP	 construction,	 increasing	 fiscal	 revenue	 sources,	 optimizing	 resource	
allocation,	and	improving	the	efficiency	of	capital	use	within	a	reasonable	range.	

Keywords		
Fiscal	Revenue;	Multiple	Linear	Regression;	Influencing	Factors;	GDP;	Eviews.	

1. Introduction	

Fiscal	revenue	is	generally	expressed	as	the	income	obtained	by	the	state	in	a	certain	period	of	
time,	 including	 tax	 revenue,	 debt	 income,	 etc.	 An	 important	 economic	 indicator	 to	measure	
finance	is	fiscal	revenue,	and	a	country's	economic	development	level,	production	technology	
level,	etc.	represent	the	wealth	of	a	country's	fiscal	revenue.	The	important	responsibilities	of	
finance	 are	 income	 distribution,	 resource	 allocation,	 economic	 stability	 and	 healthy	
development.	According	to	the	needs	of	the	economic	situation	and	the	general	environment,	
the	 third	 round	 of	 active	 fiscal	 policy	 implemented	 since	 2013	 has	 lasted	 the	 longest.	 The	
revenue	side	has	shifted	from	structural	tax	and	fee	reductions	to	comprehensive	tax	and	fee	
reductions,	 and	 the	 expenditure	 side	 has	 gradually	 shifted	 from	 infrastructure	 to	 people's	
livelihood.	In	the	past	decade,	China	has	adhered	to	a	proactive	fiscal	policy,	but	its	strength	
and	direction	are	slightly	different.	This	paper	mainly	uses	eViews	software	to	study	the	impact	
of	China's	industrial	GDP	on	fiscal	revenue,	and	concludes	conclusions	and	suggestions.	

2. Literature	Review	

In	 "Analysis	 of	 Influencing	 Factors	 of	Hebei	 Province's	 Fiscal	Revenue",	 Yang	Han	 used	 the	
stepwise	 regression	model	 to	 analyze	 the	 regional	 gross	domestic	product,	 land	acquisition	
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costs	of	real	estate	development	enterprises,	total	output	value	of	agriculture,	forestry,	animal	
husbandry	 and	 fishery,	 assets	 of	 industrial	 enterprises	 above	 designated	 size,	 etc.,	 which	
affected	Hebei	Province's	fiscal	revenue,	and	concluded	that	regional	gross	domestic	product	
(GDOP)	has	a	significant	impact	on	fiscal	revenue.	Zhu	Hailong	in	"Analysis	of	the	Influencing	
Factors	of	Anhui	Fiscal	Revenue	Based	on	Ridge	Regression	and	LASSO	Regression"	explores	
the	 influencing	 factors	 of	 Anhui	 Province's	 fiscal	 revenue	 based	 on	 the	 fiscal	 revenue	 and	
related	 economic	 index	 data	 of	 Anhui	 Province	 from	 1988	 to	 2019,	 and	 uses	 the	 Ridge	
Regression	 and	 LASSO	 Regression	 methods	 to	 explore	 the	 influencing	 factors	 of	 Anhui	
Province's	 fiscal	 revenue.	 Considering	 that	 more	 independent	 variables	 will	 cause	 serious	
multicollinearity,	the	ridge	regression	and	LASSO	regression	models	are	first	applied	to	reduce	
the	 influence	 of	 collinearity	 between	 variables,	 then	 variable	 selection,	 and	 finally	 the	 two	
models	are	compared	and	analyzed.	The	results	show	that	the	LASSO	regression	model	is	better	
than	 the	 ridge	 regression	 model.	 The	 added	 value	 of	 the	 primary	 industry,	 the	 per	 capita	
disposable	 income	of	urban	residents,	electricity	consumption	and	the	number	of	employed	
persons	in	urban	units	have	a	significant	positive	impact	on	fiscal	revenue.	The	output	value	
ratio	of	the	tertiary	industry	and	the	secondary	industry,	the	consumer	price	index	and	the	total	
wages	of	employed	persons	in	urban	units	have	a	significant	negative	impact	on	fiscal	revenue.	

3. Analysis	of	Influencing	Factors	

clothing,	so	as	to	further	improve	the	quality	of	clothing.	
(1)	Primary	sector	GDP	
The	primary	sector	refers	to	all	kinds	of	agricultural	raw	products.	It	generally	includes	farmers	
and	agriculture,	forestry,	fisheries,	animal	husbandry	and	gathering.	According	to	the	division	
of	China's	National	Bureau	of	Statistics,	the	primary	sector	refers	to	farmers	and	agriculture,	
forestry,	animal	husbandry,	fishery,	etc.	
(2)	Secondary	sector	of	economy	GDP	
The	secondary	sector	includes	all	kinds	of	professional	workers	and	all	kinds	of	industries	or	
products.	 According	 to	 the	 division	 of	 China's	 National	 Bureau	 of	 Statistics,	 the	 secondary	
industry	 refers	 to	mining,	manufacturing,	 the	 production	 and	 supply	 of	 electricity,	 gas	 and	
water,	and	construction.	
(3)	Tertiary	industry	GDP	
The	tertiary	industry	is	the	service	industry.	Generally,	it	includes:	transportation,	warehousing	
and	 postal	 industry,	 information	 transmission,	 computer	 services	 and	 software	 industry,	
wholesale	 and	 retail	 industry,	 accommodation	 and	 catering	 industry,	 financial	 real	 estate	
industry,	 leasing	 and	business	 service	 industry,	 education,	 health,	 social	 security	 and	 social	
welfare	industry,	culture,	sports	and	entertainment	industry,	public	administration	and	social	
organizations,	international	organizations	and	other	industries.	

4. Variables	and	Data	

(1)	Variables	
X1	–	Primary	sector	GDP	
X2	–	Secondary	sector	of	economy	GDP		
X3	–	Tertiary	industry	GDP	
Y	–	Our	fiscal	revenue	
(2)	Data	
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Table	1.	China's	fiscal	revenue	related	data	from	2012	to	2021	

	
Note:The	 data	 comes	 from	 the	 official	 website	 of	 the	 Ministry	 of	 Finance	 of	 the	 People's	
Republic	of	China	and	the	China	Statistical	Yearbook.	

5. Model	Establishment	and	Testing	

(1)	Trend	charts	and	related	charts	
	

 
Figure	1.	Trend	chart	

	
From	the	trend	chart,	we	can	see	that	each	explanatory	variable	changes	in	the	same	direction	
as	the	explanatory	variable,	and	the	gap	becomes	larger	the	further	back	you	go.	

	
Figure	2.	Related	chart	1	

	

	
Figure	3.	Related	chart	2	
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Figure	4.	Related	chart	3	

The	above	is	the	correlation	diagram	between	each	explanatory	variable	and	the	explanatory	
variable,	and	the	results	show	that	there	is	a	positive	and	high	linear	correlation	between	each	
explanatory	variable	and	the	explanatory	variable,	so	the	following	linear	regression	model	is	
established:	

ܻ ൌ ߙ ൅ ଵߚ ଵܺ ൅ ଶܺଶߚ ൅ ଷܺଷߚ ൅ 	ݑ
(2)	Regression	model	analysis	

	
Figure	5.	China's	fiscal	revenue	model:	

	

ܻ ൌ 107297.9 െ 1.3527 ଵܺ ൅ 0.0065ܺଶ ൅ 0.3318ܺଷ ൅ 	ݑ
	(17749.05)	(0.5802)	(0.1273)	(0.0673)	
(6.0453)	(‐2.3313)	(0.0513)	(4.9294)	

	R2	=0.9834				ܴଶതതതത=0.9750			DW=1.0920	

	F=118.1818			ߪଶ=4437.251				∑ ݁௜
ଶ=1.18E+08	

Statistical	tests:	
The	goodness‐of‐fit	R2=0.9834	is	close	to	1,	indicating	that	the	model	has	a	high	goodness‐of‐
fit.	
F	test:	F=118.1818,and	X1,	X3	accompaniment	 probability	prob(f)	is	 close	 to	0,	 the	 linear	
relationship	of	the	model	is	significant,	indicating	the	GDP	of	the	primary	industry	and	the	GDP	
of	the	secondary	industry	The	overall	impact	on	domestic	tourism	revenue	is	significant.	The	
adjoint	 probability	prob(f)	of	 X2	is	 greater	 than	0.05,	 and	 the	 linear	 relationship	 is	 not	
significant.	
T‐test:	The	absolute	value	of	the	t‐statistic	value	of	the	secondary	industry	GDP	x2	is	less	than	
2,	indicating	 that	 the	 secondary	industry	 GDP	 x2	has	 no	 significant	 effect	 on	 China's	 fiscal	
revenue	y,	 while	 the	 absolute	 value	 of	the	t‐statistic	value	 of	 other	 explanatory	 variables	 is	
greater	 than	2.	Indicates	 that	 these	 explanatory	 variables	 have	 a	 significant	 impact	 on	 the	
explanatory	variable.	
(3)	Econometric	inspection	
Multicollinearity	test:	
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The	 correlation	 coefficient	 test	 is	 performed	 in	 the	 Eviews	 software,	 and	 the	 correlation	
coefficient	matrix	is	obtained	as	follows:	
	

	
Figure	6.	The	correlation	coefficient	matrix	

	
It	can	be	seen	from	the	figure	that	there	is	a	high	linear	correlation	between	each	explanatory	
variable	and	the	explanatory	variable,	and	the	minimum	value	is	0.9184>0.8,	indicating	that	the	
model	has	severe	multicollinearity.	
Auxiliary	regression	model	test	and	variance	inflation	factor	test:	
When	explanatory	variables	exhibit	complex	correlations,	you	can	test	the	multicollinearity	of	
the	model	by	building	an	auxiliary	regression	model	between	the	explanatory	variables.	In	the	
Eviews	software,	do	the	following:	

Enter	ls	x1	c	x2	x3	
				ls	x2	c	x1	x3	
				ls	x3	c	x1	x2	

	
Figure	7.	Auxiliary	regression	model	test	1	

	

	
Figure	8.	Auxiliary	regression	model	test	2	

	

 
Figure	9.	Auxiliary	regression	model	test	3	

	
Table	2.	Variance	inflation	factor	test	
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The	F	statistic	of	the	above	model,	the	accompanying	probability	is	close	to	zero	or	less	than	
the	significance	level	of	0.05,	indicating	that	the	model	has	severe	multicollinearity,	which	can	
also	be	concluded	by	the	variance	inflation	factor	(VIF)	greater	than	10	and	tolerance	are	less	
than	0.1.	
Stepwise	regression	method:	
Build	a	univariate	regression	model:	
It	 can	be	 seen	 from	 the	 above	 correlation	 coefficient	matrix	 that	 the	 correlation	 coefficient	
between	the	explanatory	variable	tertiary	industry	GDP	x3	and	the	explanatory	variable	China's	
fiscal	revenue	y	is	the	largest	and	the	strongest	correlation,	so	the	regression	model	Y=a+bX3+	
of	the	tertiary	industry	GDP	x3	is	established	The	most	basic	model.	
Bring	the	remaining	variables	into	the	model	one	by	one,	enter	in	the	Eviews	software.	

ls	y	c	x3	
		ls	y	c	x3	x1	
		ls	y	c	x3	x2	

	
Figure	10.	Stepwise	regression	1	

	

	
Figure	11.	Stepwise	regression	2	

	

	
Figure	12.	Stepwise	regression	3	

	
Table	3.	The	results	of	the	step‐by‐step	test	
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After	the	above	step‐by‐step	test	process,	the	selected	model	is:	y=f(x3,x1).	
Y=	107700.9		+		0.3343x3		‐		1.3417x1	
(14740.41)	(0.043591)	(0.499356)	
(7.306506)	(7.669303)	(‐2.686865)	

R2	=0.9834				ܴଶതതതത=0.9786	
	DW=1.119756		F=206.7259			prob(F)=	0.000001			

∑			ଶ=4108.998ߪ ݁௜
ଶ=1.18E+08	

Goodness‐of‐fit	test:	R2	=0.9834	is	close	to	1,	indicating	that	the	model	has	a	high	goodness‐of‐
fit	to	the	sample	data.	
F	test:	The	value	of	the	F	statistic	is	206.7259,	and	the	accompanying	probability	is	0.000001,	
indicating	that	the	overall	 linear	relationship	of	the	model	is	significant,	 indicating	that	each	
explanatory	variable	has	a	fiscal	income	y	for	the	explanatory	variable	ct;	
T‐test:	This	model	makes	reasonable	economic	sense,	but	the	absolute	value	of	the	t‐statistic	
value	of	rural	residents'	per	capita	tourism	expenditure	X2	in	the	explanatory	variables	is	less	
than	 2,	 indicating	 that	 the	 secondary	 industry	 GDP	 x4	 There	was	 no	 significant	 impact	 on	
domestic	tourism	revenues.	
Self‐correlation	test:	
DW	test:	given	a	significance	level	of	0.05,	sample	size	n=10,	k=2,	ding	the	DW	table,	the	lower	
limit	value	dL=0.697,	the	upper	value	dU=1.641,	and	the	dL<DW=1.119756<	dU,	ned.	
Partial	correlation	coefficient	test:	
In	the	eViews	software,	the	autocorrelation	coefficient	and	partial	correlation	coefficient	plot	
for	each	period	are	shown	below.	
	

	
Figure	13.	Self‐correlation	test	

	
As	can	be	seen	from	the	figure,	there	is	no	autocorrelation	in	this	model.	
BG	 test:	The	result	of	obtaining	a	hysteresis	of	1	and	a	hysteresis	of	2	 in	 the	software	 is	as	
follows:	
	

	
Figure	14.	BG	test	1	
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Figure	15.	BG	test	

	
As	can	be	seen	from	the	figure	above,	nR2=0.8454<ܺ଴.଴ହ

ଶ ሺ2ሻ=5.991,	prob(tR)=0.5236	is	greater	
than	0.05,	and	the	absolute	values	of	the	T	statistic	for	the	et‐1	regression	coefficient	are	all	less	
than	that	2,	indicating	that	the	model	does	not	have	first‐order	autocorrelation.	
Heteroscedasticity	test:	
White	Test:	
In	the	eViews	software,	do	the	following:	

smpl	2012	2021	
ls	y	c	x3	x1	

	
Figure	16.	White	Test	

	
nR2=4.2306߯ۦఈଶሺ݌ሻ ൌ ߯଴.଴ହ

ଶ ሺ5ሻ ൌ 11.070,	its	prob(nR2)The	adjoint	probability	is	0.5176,	which	
is	 greater	 than	 the	 given	 significance	 level	 ߙ =0.05,	 there	 is	 no	 heteroscedasticity	 in	 the	
regression	model.	
ARCH	Inspection:	
The	result	is	shown	in	the	following	figure:	

	
Figure	17.	ARCH	Inspection	
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The	 results	 above	 show	 the	 results	 at	 lag	 stage	 1,	 in	 stage	 1	 (n‐p)	 R2=0.793857൏ ߯ఈଶሺ݌ሻ ൌ
߯଴.଴ହ
ଶ ሺ1ሻ ൌ3.841,	the	results	show	that	there	is	no	heteroscedasticity	in	the	regression	model.	

6. Final	Model	Establishment	

Through	the	above	tests,	it	is	determined	that	the	final	model	is:	
Y=	107700.9		+		0.3343x3	‐		1.3417x1	
(14740.41)(0.043591)(0.499356)	
(7.306506)(7.669303)(‐2.686865)	

R2	=0.9834					ܴଶതതതത=0.9786	
	DW=1.119756		F=206.7259			prob(F)=	0.000001			

∑			ଶ=4108.998ߪ ݁௜
ଶ=1.18E+08	

The	model	indicates	that	when	the	GDP	x3	of	the	tertiary	industry	increases	by	1	unit,	China's	
fiscal	revenue	y	will	increase	by	an	average	of	33.43	million	yuan;	When	the	GDP	of	the	primary	
industry	x1	increases	by	1	unit,	China's	fiscal	revenue	will	decrease	by	an	average	of	134.17	
million	yuan.	

7. Conclusion	

Under	the	influence	of	China's	specific	national	conditions	and	the	international	environment,	
the	 relationship	 between	 GDP	 and	 fiscal	 revenue	 will	 show	 a	 certain	 correlation,	 and	 the	
possible	reasons	are:	changes	in	fiscal	and	taxation	policies,	such	as	the	state	increasing	the	tax	
rate	of	certain	types	of	products,	or	implementing	a	tight	monetary	policy,	and	the	impact	of	
the	external	environment,	such	as	China's	current	development	stage	and	its	position	in	the	
world.	 However,	 these	 variables	 can	 only	 be	 treated	 as	 random	 perturbation	 terms,	 partly	
because	 some	 factors	 cannot	be	 represented	by	data,	 and	partly	 for	 the	 convenience	of	 the	
model.	
Generally	 speaking,	 the	 growth	 of	 fiscal	 revenue	 and	 GDP	 should	 maintain	 a	 certain	
proportional	 relationship,	 and	 I	 established	 a	 regression	 model	 and	 estimated	 the	 results	
through	eViews	software	to	conclude	that	they	have	a	certain	linear	correlation,	which	seems	
to	be	a	healthy	and	stable	development	trend	at	present.	However,	returning	to	reality,	we	have	
to	consider	that	if	the	growth	of	fiscal	revenue	deviates	too	much	from	the	speed	of	economic	
growth	or	is	higher	than	the	speed	of	economic	growth	for	a	long	time,	it	may	cause	the	people	
to	be	overburdened	and	unable	to	enjoy	the	benefits	brought	by	economic	growth,	and	at	the	
same	 time,	 it	 will	 affect	 the	 efficiency	 of	 government	 investment,	 resulting	 in	 uneven	
distribution	of	residents'	income,	etc.,	and	suggest	that	a	virtuous	circle	between	fiscal	revenue	
and	economic	development	be	realized.	
The	correct	handling	of	the	relationship	between	fiscal	revenue	and	GDP	has	always	been	an	
important	 issue	on	China's	economic	development	milestones,	and	the	proportion	of	output	
value	and	fiscal	revenue	of	various	industries	should	be	controlled	within	a	reasonable	range,	
so	 that	 fiscal	 revenue	 and	 GDP	 will	 promote	 each	 other	 and	 develop	 together,	 ensure	 the	
development	 of	 various	 government	 functions,	 reduce	 the	 regulation	 and	 control	 of	
macroeconomic	operation	and	resource	allocation	optimization,	and	not	affect	the	income	of	
collectives,	enterprises	and	individual	workers	in	the	primary	distribution,	so	as	not	to	dampen	
their	enthusiasm.	Achieve	the	ultimate	goal	of	healthy	development	of	the	national	economy	
and	increasing	living	standards	of	the	people.	At	the	same	time,	attention	should	also	be	paid	to	
controlling	the	growth	rate	of	fiscal	revenue	relative	to	GDP	within	a	reasonable	range	of	20%‐
25%,	so	as	to	avoid	"inflated"	growth.	
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